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Judges’ recognition award

Dr Oliver Hartwich

Aman for all seasons

Ourmission
statement when the
Initiative started 12
years agowas to

make New Zealand
a better country for
all its people — and
that statement still

stands today.
Dr Oliver Hartwich, executive director

of NZ Initiative

Graham Skellern

I n another world, Dr Oliver
Hartwich would love to have
been a comedian.
Taking the mickey out of some-

thing is in stark contrast to his serious
role of helping to create public policy.

Friendly and effervescent, he is a
man of many talents. He is an experi-
enced economist, an accomplished
policy advisor, a savvy columnist,
essayist and broadcaster (he likes
making podcasts), a reluctant lawyer,
and an engaging and entertaining
public speaker.

That’swhyhe likes his job somuch
as executivedirector of the think tank
The New Zealand Initiative. He can
utilise all those talents.

But there’s one other talent — he
enjoys writing satire, on the side. “In
an ideal world I could have become
a comedian but I needed something
to pay the bills.”

Hartwichmoved from the Sydney-
based think tank The Centre for In-
dependent Studies in 2012 and built
the Wellington-based New Zealand
Initiative, formed through a merger
between the New Zealand Institute
and the New Zealand Business
Roundtable.

“It’s such a diverse role and I can
translate complicated things in a form
of language that people understand
without them being an expert in the
field.Ourmission statementwhen the
Initiative started 12 years ago was to
make New Zealand a better country
for all its people — and that statement
still stands today.”

The Initiative conducts independ-
ent research and injects new ideas
into political debates on a wide range
of policy issues — from education to
economic policy, poverty to housing,
and from local government to immi-
gration.

Hartwich and his impressive PhD
team of research fellows have estab-
lished The Initiative as a credible new
voice in the country’s political
debates.

His thought leadership has earned
him the Deloitte Top 200 Judges’
Recognition Award. The judges said
The Initiative produces thought-pro-
voking, independent research and
policy recommendations on topics
that are freely available to the public.

“Oliver has been a key contributor
to the public dialogue, not simply in
identifying the key issues we face as
a country but how we might address
them. We recognise his sterling con-
tribution topublic policy thinking and
his willingness to advocate publicly
through significant media engage-
ment.”

The judges said in recentyearsThe
Initiative’s policy prescriptions have
been influential in key and critical
policy areas, with a particular note
about education.

A German native who now
proudly calls New Zealand home,
Oliver has brought to New Zealand
a combination of his personable com-
munication style matched by his im-
pressive experience in developing
public policy in the United Kingdom
as chief economist at the Policy
Exchange, and advisor in the House
of Lords, as well as being a Research
Fellow for the Centre of Independent
Studies in Australia, the judges said.

Education — a priority
Hartwich is feeling proud that the
Coalition Government has heard The
Initiative’s calls to improve the edu-
cation system.

“We want a decent education sys-
tem that delivers opportunities to
every child in life —unfortunately this
hasn’t always been the case. We’ve
declined in the OECD education test
Pisa (Programme for International
Assessment that evaluates the know-
ledge and skills of 15-year-old
students in reading, mathematics,
and science).

“Over the last two decades, half of
the 15-year-olds are as good as
13-year-olds were — that’s how much
we have lost. The problem with lit-
eracy and numeracy is that more

than 40% of school leavers today are
functionally illiterate.

“We’ve argued that the system
needs to be improved with a new,
knowledge-rich curriculum,better ca-
reer structure for teachers and
improved assessment system. We’ve
been on the same path for 12 years.

“Teachers have been taught on
sociology theory, but you talk to
young teachers and they don’t feel
they have the education to succeed
in front of a classroom. That is the
problem. There needs to be a
recalibration towards abetter integra-
tion of trained and tested teaching
skills and methods that are used in
front of the class.

“There’s been a belief that if you
expose students to new knowledge,
they will just absorb it. Teachers still
need to instruct students directly
about how it works,” said Hartwich.

In early August, the government
announced the first three compon-
ents of Make it Count — a new maths
curriculum that will be introduced in
term one next year with resources,
including teacher and student
workbooks provided in every prim-
ary and intermediate school.

There will be twice-yearly stand-
ardised assessments for maths in

primary schools and small group
interventions to support students
who have fallen significantly behind.
A sum of $20 million is provided for
professional development in
structured maths for new teachers.

More policy initiatives
Hartwich and his team have been
pressing the case for local councils
and Central Government sharing the

tax revenue from new residential
development and thus easing the
burden on infrastructure costs and
housing affordability.

More housing would lead to more
funding for local services and infra-
structure. The Initiative’s research
has shown that basing payments on
new building consents or completed
builds could provide the strongest
incentives for councils.

“All that councils have [at present]
are the costs of providing infra-
structure, such as roads and water,
while the tax revenue on new builds
goes to Wellington. That’s the main
problem behind the housing market
and affordability.

“There needs to be better financial
incentives for new development that
creates economic activity. We have
to make sure councils keep some of
the extra tax revenue from develop-
ment.”

Hartwich is pleased the Govern-
ment is now considering sharing GST
revenue with councils and it might
even be on a 50/50 basis.

Aligned with this, The Initiative is
promoting localism. “When we
started thisword in 2012no-oneknew
what it was,” said Hartwich.

Localism is formal agreements

between various stakeholders — cen-
tral and local government, busi-
nesses, tertiary institutions, iwi — to
align their efforts around shared
strategies and investments tailored to
a specific area. They provide a path-
way for devolving powers and
funding to the local level, giving com-
munities the tools they need to shape
their own futures.

Hartwich is heartened by the
moves from government to encour-
agemore international capital. “We’ve
argued the point that New Zealand
needs to be more welcoming — it has
one of the more restrictive Foreign
Direct Investment (FDI) regimes in the
OECD.

“I’m happy with the announce-
ment from (Associate Finance Minis-
ter) David Seymour that that themain
criterion for checking FDI
applications is whether the proposer
has negative implications for New
Zealand’s national security.

“It will make it easier for
applications and for capital to come
to New Zealand. The more bureau-
cratic processes deter investment.
Ideally, we should abolish the Over-
seas Investment Act — New Zealand
doesn’t need it — and roll out the red
carpet to international investors like
the Netherlands and Ireland have
done.”

Hartwich said New Zealand has
made it hard (for foreign investment)
becauseof amentality issue. “The fear
that we will become tenants in our
owncountry is not justified. FDI offers
trade, job opportunities and econom-
ic growth.”

Next onHartwich’s agenda is trans-
port costs and introducing a Smart
Road User Charges system nation-
wide to replace the current fuel ex-
cise duty, and therefore reduce the
price of petrol. Under the system,
vehicles would be charged based on
actual road usage, time of day, and
vehicle type. The proposed system
aims to reduce congestion, improve
road maintenance, and ensure a
fairer distribution of costs.

From Essen
toWellington
DrOliverHartwichwasbroughtup
in the industrial heartlandofEssen,
thehomeof coal and steel. “It
wasn’t theprettiest part of
Germanybut itwas themost
honest.”

He studiedatRuhrUniversity
BochumandgainedaMaster’s
Degree in Economics andBusiness
Administration.He thenbecamea
researchassistant at theBonn
University concentratingon
competition law issues, and tooka
yearout in 2001as a visiting fellow
to theSydneyLawSchool.

HartwichcompletedhisPhD in
Lawbackat Bochumuniversitybut
“I didn’twant tobecomea lawyer;
itwaspurely anacademic interest.”

Therewas another reason for
travelling toAustralia— tomeethis
penfriendof eight yearswho lived
inAdelaide.

HeandJuliemarried inLondon
in2004whenHartwichwas
assistingLordOakeshott of
SeagroveBay in theHouseof Lords
onpensions legislation.

Heworkedat the think tank
PolicyExchange inLondon from
2005-08, becomingchief
economist beforedeciding tomake
anothermove.

“ShewaskeenonBerlin; Iwas
keenonSydney. Iwon.”

Hartwich spent four years at The
Centre for Independent Studies in
Sydneybefore takinguphisnew
role inWellington.

“Whenwemoved toNew
Zealand in2012,webought ahouse
and twoweeks in thecountrymy
wifegotpregnant.

“Leo is now11 yearsold andwe
arevery settledhere,”Hartwich
said.

Regaining our ambition
NewZealandcouldhaveavoided the
economicpain if theReserveBankhad
simplynot stimulated theeconomyas
muchas it did, saysTheNewZealand
InitiativeexecutivedirectorDrOliver
Hartwich.

In the response to theCovid
pandemic, thebank flooded the
marketwithmoneyand it only created
inflation, he says.

“Wehada supply shock – supply
chainswere severely disrupted –and
the labourmarketwasextremely tight
drivingwage inflation. This created
headaches for companies in an

overheatedeconomy.
“After creating the inflation, the

bankhas tried toget it back in the
bottleby increasing theofficial cash
rate anddrivingusdeliberately intoa
recession.

“Itwasn’t goodeconomic
management from theReserveBank.
Itwill takeusa fewyears to settledown
aftermucheconomicpain,”Hartwich
says.

“With interest rates comingdown
againandwith theeconomic reforms
thegovernment is undertaking, things
will get better.

“In thenext yearor twoweshould
getback togood times.”

Hartwich said “whatweareworking
on is tomakeNewZealanddobetter.
Thecountryneeds tobecome
ambitiousagain.

“If you lookout there, the rest of
theworldhasmovedonandNew
Zealandhas somecatch-up todo.

“Weput toomuch faith in the
previousgovernment, bureaucrats
and regulators.Weshouldhave
unlockedprivate initiatives and relied
on themarkets togrowand take the
opportunities,” saidHartwich.


